
 
 
COLWICH PARISH COUNCIL 

 

Colwich Parish Council Disclosure Log 

 

Request: CPC FOI 02/26 

 

Subject: 2026-27 Budget 

 

Question: 

 

1.Parish Council precept for tax year 2026/2027. 

2.Total Parish Council budget for tax year 2026/2027. 

3.Gross employment costs included in 2026/2027 budget. 

4.Number of paid employees categorised by part time and full-time employees. 

5.Combined total paid hours for both part time and full-time staff. 

6.How may properties by Council tax band A to H are located in the Parish. 

7.The total number of Band D equivalent properties used in calculating the precept for the 

26/27 budget. 

8.What is the size of population served by the Parish Council. 

 

Response: 

 

1.This information is available on the Council’s website. 

2.This information is available on the Council’s website. 

3.This information is available on the Council’s website. 

4.This information is available on the Council’s website. 

5.This information is available on the Council’s website. 

6. The Council does not hold this information. 
7. The 2026/27 taxbase, provided by Stafford Borough Council, is 1,904.94 

8. The Council does not hold this information. 


